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PETRONAS WORK INSTRUCTION
6 SUPPLIER RELATIONSHIP MANAGEMENT (SRM)

Revision: Approved

BE Manage eRFx (for Bidder - 2 Tier Evaluation)v2

Transaction Overview

What
Use this procedure to response to the RFQ sent by the purchaser.
When
Perform this procedure when responding to the RFQ invitation (2 Tier Evaluation).
Prerequisites
e RFQ invitation has been sent out to bidder via email
Menu Path

To login to SRM Portal, go to https://supplier-selfservice.petronas.com.my/irj/portal

Transaction Code

Not Applicable

Roles
e Bidder
Helpful Hints
R [ Required field entry
o) | Optional field entry
C | Conditional field entry
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Screen Flow

‘F'__;- Delete Password

Bvent Number

| Apply

‘.‘:- Participate

N ! e L

‘."_.'; Create Rezponze

e
How many extra quantity ...
P Questions
-
™ Yes
=
‘."_.;- Motes and Attachments
?_.;' T ltemz
™ Details
-

Price

Delivery Days (Calendar)

?'__;: Questions

™ Yes
-
‘F'_.'; " Motes and Attachments
'F'_.'; © Summary
=

~ Tracking

?'__'; RFx WVersions

™| _Technical RFx Response |

‘P__'; For Bidder

‘F:- Tender Document. docx

= Do

) TECHNICAL

BID

Description

O Shift+T

'F'_.'; | Close this dialog box when ¢
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Procedure
1.

Start the transaction by login to the SRM portal at https://ebp.petronas.com.my.

SUS Home - SAP NetWeaver Portal - Windows Internet Explorer

Wielcome TANJUNG OFF SHORE SERVICES *

Agvanced Search

5US Home
l41»] 4
| porm ravores Si=| SAP SRM  1ome
« Find
 Purchase Orders
= Confirmed

w Purchase Orders
= All
= New
= Changed
= In Process.
= Confirmed
w Purchase Orders
= Confirmed
~ Confirmations.
= All
~ Confirmations.
- All
~ Invoices and Credit Memos
= All
= In Process.
= Document Sent
= Approved
= Rejected
= Create Invoice
 Hotifications from Purchaser
= Goods Receipt - All
= Goods Receipt - New
» Cancelation of Goods Receipt - All

2. Click RFx and Auctions (EHP1)

per email.

| History, Back Forward [=]
Find AM
4 StartPage
|_start Page

All Purchase Orders

New (27 ) and Changed (4 )
In Process

Confirmed and Partially Confirmed

All Invoices and Credit Memos

Accepted and Rejected
Create

ﬂ Own Data

I Messages

All Confirmations
Accepted and Partially Accepted
Rejected
Create

=4

All Goods Receipts
All Canceled Goods Receipts

All Return Deliveries

The table does not contain any entries

tab control

. Search for RFQ number as

RFx and Auctions - SAP NetWeaver Portal - Windows Internet Explorer provided by

iPerintis Sdn. Bhd.

password

/By No switch to HTTPS occurred, so it is not secure to send a

This is an intial password that must be changed

3.  For the first time log on, Click Delete Password button in order to proceed to next
step.

User. SRM_TAN

Current Password: * ﬂ:|

New Password: * |:|

Repeat Password: * [ |

Delete Password 3
- -
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RFx and Auctions - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Welcome TANJUHG OFFSHORE SERVICES Loa oft
RFx and Auctions (EHP1)
Overview | Service Map
RFx and Auctions | History, Back Forward E
¥
S
Active Queries
eRFxs All(3%) Published (4) Ended (30} Completed (0}
Aucti Al(0) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (0)

eRFxs - All

 Hide Quick Criteria Maintenance Change Query Define New Query Personalize

Event Number, & [ he

Event Status: Event Number

My R From: -

51 Apply
View: |[Standard View] [=] || create Response | [ Display Event || Display R: eview | | Refresh || Export | Fiter Settings

BL EventNumber  EventDescription Event Type EventStatus  StartDate  End Date Response Number  Response Status  EventVersion  Response Version QsA [+]
6200000084 RFX_CREATE11 28.10.2011 15:04:00 RFQ 2Tier Evaluation Published 28102011 No Bid Created 1 0
£200000037 (Copy of 6200000031) RFQ 2Tier Evaluation Published 29.09.2011 9000000216 Rejected 1 2 0
6200000033 (Copy of 6200000032) RFQ 2Tier Evaluation Published 28082011 $000000206 Submitted 1 2 0|
6200000021 RFX_CREATE11 20.09.2011 11:11:59 RFQ 2Tier Evaluation Published 20.09.2011 9000000134 Submitted 2 2 0
6200000016 WSOFFIAN 14.08.2011 12:38:42 RFQ ZTier Evaluation Published 14.08.2011 2000000121 Accepted T 4 0
6100000334 RFX_CREATE11 28.10.2011 12:30:28 RFQ 1Tier Evaluation Published 28102011 9000000389 Submitted 2 2 0
£100000332 Test on RFQ form Contact Person RFQ 1Tier Eval(Hier) Published 31.102011 No Bid Created 1 0
6100000330 similuate G scenario on awards. RFQ 1Tier Eval(Hier) Published 24102011 5000000383 Submitted 1 2 0
6100000317 PYLIM 17.10.2011 16:55:37 RFQ 1Tier Evaluation Published 17.10.2011 9000000386 Submitted 1 2 0
6100000315 PYLIM 17.10.2011 14:21:13 RFQ 1Tier Evaluation Published 01.12.2011 No Bid Created 1 0 [+

Last Refresh 28.10.2011 15:16:22 UTC+8 Refresh 5)

4. As required, complete/review the following fields:

Field R/O/C Description

Event Number: R Enter keyword to search for RFQ.

Example:
6200000064

5. Click Apply button

Rev. Date: 28/10/2011 (For Internal Use Only) Prepared By: PQL
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RFx and Auctions - SAP NetWeaver Portal

]

6.

Vielcome TANJUNG OFFSHORE SERVICES o

RFx and Auctions
Active Queries
eRFxs All(1) Published (4) Ended (30} Completed (0)
cti All(0) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (0}
eRFxs - All

 Hide Quick Criteria Maintenance

Event Number =i[e200000064 | 7o [ | &
Event Status: I:El
My From: ’—F‘
View: [Standard View] =] [cr | Dis ent |[ Display P | Refresh |[ Export 4 |
E. Event Number Event Description Event Type Event Status Start Date End Date
il B4 RFX_CREATE11 28.10.2011 15:04:00 RFQ 2Tier Evaluation Published 28102011

Response Number

| History, Back Forward E

Change Query Define New Query P s

Fiter Sttings
Response Status Event Version Response Version Qaa
No Bid Created 1 (]

Last Refresh 28.10.2011 15:16:42 UTC+8 Refresh [

Click on the RFQ number, for example - 6200000064 link label 5200000064

RFx - SAP NetWeaver Portal

7.

Click Participate button [Participate |

RFx —thtory,Back Farward =1 7
¥
Display RFx : 6200000064 Hep
RFx Number 6200000064 RFx Name RFX_CREATE11 28.10.2011 15:04:00 RFX Status Published RFx Start Date ‘Submission Deadline 28.10.2011 15:30:00 UTC+3
Remaining Time RFx Number 0 Days 00:13:11 RFx Owher RFX_CREATE11 RFx Version Number 1 RFx Version Type Active Version
[Print Preview | | [Refresh | | [Technical RFx | [Paricipate | | Do Not Participate | | Questions and Answers (0 ) |
RFX Information ftems [ Notes and Attachments.
RFx s | Questios | Note and
Time Zone: UTC+8
Submission Deadline: * |28.10.2011 15:30:00
Currency WMYR
w Farners and Delivery Information =]
| Details || Add . |[ Send E-Mail || call |[ Clear | Fiter Seftings
Function Number Name Phone Number
= Requester PYLIM
= Goods Recipient PYLIM
= Ship-To Address Comp 0003 ADDADDRTEL
= Location PCSB Peninsular Malaysia Ops 09-23640722
| Print Preview | | [Refresh | | [Technical RFx | [ Participat | [ Do Not Participate | [ Questions and Answers (0) |

Rev.

Date: 28/10/2011
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RFx - SAP NetWeaver Portal

RFx History, Back Forward E
]
Display RFx : 6200000064 Heip
RFx Number 8200000084 RFx Name RFX_CREATE1128.10.2011 15:04:00 RFX Status Published RFx Start Date Submission Deadline 28.10.2011 15:30:00 UTC+3
Remaining Time RFx Number 0 Days 00:12:43 RFx Owner RFX_CREATE11 RFx Version Number 1 RFx Version Type Active Version
_{_f “Your response has been sent, you will be informed of changes via e-mail
8 fetose——fPri evr—f b H ipateH Create Response | | Questions and Answers (0 ) |
RFX Information tems -~ Notes and Attachments

RFx s | Ouest | Note and

Time Zone: UTC+8

Submission Deadline: * |28.10.2011 15:30:00

Currency WYR

W Partners and Delivery Information =]

Details || Add Send E-Mail || Call || Clea: Fiter Seftings
Function Number Name Phone Number
= Requester PYLIM
= Goods Recipient PYLIM
= Ship-To Address Comp 0003 ADDADDRTEL
= Location PCSB Peninsular Malaysia Ops 09-8540722
[Print Preview | | [Refresh | | [Technical RFx | [ Do Not Participate | [ Create Response | [ Questions and Answers (0 |

8. Click Create Response button | Create Response |

The system displays message, "Your response has been sent, you will be informed of
b changes via e-mail”.
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Create RFx Response - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Create RFx

]

Create RFix Response

RFx Response Numpber 9000000391
RFx Responge Version Number Activ

i@ Line 0001: Please

o Line 0001: Please ¢nter question header reply

RFx Number 8200000084

Status In Process Submission Deadline 28.10.2011 15:30:00 UTC+3 RFx Owner RFX_CREATE11
e Version RFx Version Number 1

nter tem delivery days (Delivery period from PO creation date)

[ Read Only | [ Print Preview |

[Technical RFx Response | [Questions and Answers (0) |

RFx Informatjon ftems | Notes and Attachments [ Summary [ Tracking
BasicData  Questions | Notes and Attachments

Total Value 0.00 MYR

Event Parameters

Currency: Walaysian Ringgit

Terms of Payment: | ZB30 ‘Within 30 days

Function

+ Goods Recipient

= Ship-To Address

= Location

Service and Delivery

N loor 3] i
Due net Status and Statistics
Created On 28.10.2011 15:18:30 UTC+8
Created By Mr. Tanjung Offshere Services
Last Processed On: 28.10.2011 15:18:30 UTC+2
Last Processed By: Mr. Tanjung Offshore Services
Number Name
PYLIM
Comp 0003

PCSB Peninsular Malaysia Ops

[ Read Only | [ Print Preview |

[Technical RFx Response | [Questions and Answers (0) |

bidders.

Create RFx Response - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Create RFx Response

Fitter Seftings

Phone Number

ADDADDRTEL
09-8640722

On RFx Information tab, click Questions menu item Questiens, Answer all questions posted by the

¥
Create RFx Response

RFx Response Number 000000391

RFx Response Version Number Active Version

RFx Number E200000064 Status In Process

Submission Deadline 28.10.2011 15:30:00 UTC+2
RFx Version Number 1

RFx Owner RFX_CREATE11

History, Back Forward E

Heip

Total Value 0.00 MYR

§ Attribute Are you mse company? is mandatory; maintain attribute value
0 Aftribute How many extra quantity you can offer? is mandatory; maintain attribute value

(D) Line D0D1: Please enter item delivery days (Delivery period from PO creation date)

o Line 0001: Please enter question header reply

Read Only | | Print Preview

Technical RFx Response Questions and Answers (0 )

- RFx Information ftems [ MNotes and Attachments |  Summary ©  Tracking

12 T T t and

Question Reply Comment
10 FATE YOU TEE COMpany. Yes (" No
1 How many exira Quantity you can offer. o] PC

[Read Only | [ Print Preview |

[Check | [ Technical RFx Response | [ Save | [ Questions and Answers (0 |

Rev. Date: 28/10/2011
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10. Click Yes radio button © Y&s,
11. As required, complete/review the following fields:
Field R/O/C Description

How many extra R .
. ) Answer all questions

quantity you can offer?:

Example:

300

12. Click Notes and Attachments menu item Motes and Attachments view all notes or attachment.

Create RFx Response - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Create RFx Response
¥

History, Back Forward [=]

Create RFx Response Help

RFx Response Number 3000000381 RFx Number 6200000064 Status In Process Submission Deadline 28.10.2011 15:30:00 UTC+8 RFx Owner RFX_CREATEM Total Value 0.00 MYR
RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number 1

ﬂ Line 0001: Please enter item delivery days (Delivery period from PO creation date)

[Read Only | [ Print Preview | | [Check | [Technical RFx Response | [ Save | [ Questions and Answers (0) |

13 -—m[ tems ©  MNotes and Attachments ©  Summary Tracking

rﬂas\c Data Questions. Notes and Attachments

- lotas O

Fitter Settings

Category Description
RFQ Header Text —Empty-
Bidder's Remarks —Empty-
Instruction to Bid —Empty-
Delivery Instructions —Empty-
Terms and Condtions —Empty-
Withholding Tax —Empty-
¥ Attachments [
Edit Description || Versioning . |[ Delete |[ Create Profie Fiter Settings
Category Description File Name Version Processor Type Size (KB) Changed by Changed on

[3] The table does not contain any data

[Read Only | [ Print Preview | | [ Check | [ Technical RFx Response | | Save | [ Questions and Answers (0 |

13.

Click Items tab control | "&ms

Rev. Date: 28/10/2011 (For Internal Use Only) Prepared By: PQL
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Create RFx Response - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Create RF; pistory, Baci Forwsrd =) 14
’ fJ
Create RFx Response
RFx Response NHumber 000000391 RFx Number 8200000064 Status In Process Submission Deadline 28.10.2011 15:30:00 UTC+8 RFx Owner RFX_CREATE11 Total Value 0.00 MYR RFx Response Ve
RFx Version Number 1
1 Line|0001: Please enter tem defivery days (Delivery period from PO creation date)
Subnjit Read Only | [ Print Preview Technical RFx Response Questions and Answers (0}
AFx Information | items } Notes and Attachments Summary Tracking
w ftefn Overview
Details | ~ 0 Fiter Expand Al
Lai E=eeT femType Product D Product Catenory | Product Category Bescipin | Recured Guenily | Submsiied Gueniy | Uil | Price | Garency: | Price Per | Delveay Dok | okl Vakee | PR
. ﬁ 0001[F] OILFILTER 100, NON GREASE  Material 59990317 Gas Turbine 10 10 EA 000 MYR 1 On121220M1 000 O/C
e | | —_— = — — =
‘ »

14. Click Details button
once PO is received.

. You are required to enter Price of the products and Delivery days

Create RFx Response - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Create RFx Response sisiory,  Back Forwars (= 1§
]
Details for item 0001 OIL FILTER 100, NON GREASE
16 -~ temBata—— Questions MNotes and Attachments.
W Basic Data
Identification Currency, Values and Pricing
Configurable ftem Number: * [0001 Currency: Malaysian Ringgit
Control Key: Material functional Reguired Quantity: 10| EA
ftem Type: Material Sueed QU 10/
Product Category: PR1030100 Gas Turbine g 0.00 [MiiEiEas 1IES
Product ID: 58980317 Service and Delivery
Description: OIL FILTER 100, NON GREASE Delivery Date: 12.12.2011
ttem Variant Description: QOriginal tem Delivery Days (Calendar). [000 | J

Incots Key/Locati
Supplier Product Humber incoterm Keyilocation

Status and Statistics
Net value: 0.00

Service Breakdown

“w Partners and Delivery Information

Function Number Name Ph
= Requester PYLIM
= Goods Recipient PYLIM
» Ship-To Address Comp 0003 AL
= Location PCSB Peninsular Malaysia Ops 0%

| Read Only | [ Print Previews | | [ Check | [ Technical RFx Response | [ Save | [ Questions and Answers (0) |
4
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15. As required, complete/review the following fields:

Field R/O/C Description

Price: R

Example:
25

Enter price of material / service charge offered by bidder.

Delivery Days R . . .
(Calendar): Enter delivery days taken to deliver service / goods.
Example:

3

Questions

16.  Click Questions tab control . Answer all questions posted by the purchaser.

Create RFx Response - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Create RFx Response History, Back Forward =)

k
LICdLE KA KCOpUIIDT a

RFx Response Number 3000000391 RFx Number 6200000064 Status In Process Submission Deadline 28.10.2011 15:30:00 UTC+& RFx Owner RFX_CREATE11 Total Value 250.00 MYR RFx Response Ve
RFx Version Number 1

| Read Only | [ Print Previews | | [ Check | [ Technical RFx Response | [ Save | [ Questions and Answers (0) |
18 -—Rﬁ-'rrfumhm——lmrm—" Hotes and Attachments. Summary Tracking

W tem Overview

Add Ne Co Paste || Delete Calculate Value Fiter Expand All C
Line Number  Description ltemType Product D Product Category Product Category Descripion  Required Quantity Submitted Quantty Unt Price Currency Price Per Delivery Date  TotalValue RFx/|
- ﬁ 0001 OILFILTER 100, NON GREASE  Material 59990317 ‘Gas Turbine 10 10 EA 2500 MYR 1 On12122011 25000 0/0

Details for item 0001 OIL FILTER 100, NON GREA SE

tem Data [+t Notes and Attachments
Question Reply Comment
Is this product manufacture by your company?: e i
[ Read Oniy | [ Print Preview | | Technical RFx Responss | | Save | [ Questions and Answers (0) ] -
4 »

17. Click Yes radio button © &=,

18. Notes and Attachments

Click Notes and Attachments tab control |

17

Rev. Date: 28/10/2011 (For Internal Use Only) Prepared By: PQL
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Create RFx Response - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Create RFx Response
¥

Create RFx Response

RFx Response Number 000000391

RFx Number E200000064
RFx Response Version Number Active Version

Status In Process

Submission Deadline 28.10.2011 15:30:00 UTC+2
RFx Version Number 1

RFx Owner RFX_CREATE11

History, Back Forward E

Hep

Total Value 250.00 MYR

[Read Only | [ Print Previewr | | [Check | [ Technical RFx Response | [ Save | [Questions and Answers (0]
19 RFximformatiom ftems- Hotes-and i Summary | Tracking
¥ Notes. [
Clza Fiter Seffings
Assigned To  Category Text Preview
¥ Attachments [
Edit Description || Versioning Profile Fiter Seffings
Assigned To Category Description File Name Version Processor Checked Out Type Size (KB) Changed by Changed on
(3] The table does not contain any data
[Read Only | [ Print Previewr | | [Check | [ Technical RFx Response | [ Save | [ Questions and Answers (0]
19 7 Summary
. .
Click Summary tab control .
Create RFx Response History, Back Forward E
¥
Create RFx Response Help
RFx Response Number 9000000391 RFx Number 6200000064 Status In Process. Submission Deadline 28.10 2011 15:30:00 UTC+3 RFx Owner RFX_CREATET1 Total Value 250.00 MYR
RFx Response Version Number Active Version

RFx Version Number 1

ttems with Response:
Questions:

Notes:

Attachments:

Total RFx Response Value:

[Read Only | [ Print Preview | | [Check | [ Technical RFx Response | [ Save | [ Questions and Answers (0 )]
S ——
20 RFx-imformatiom fems Hotesamd ? Tracking
RFx Response Number: 9000000391

1 out of 1 tems responded
3 out of 3 questions answered ( 2 out of 2 mandatory)
No Notes Added
Ne Attachments Added
250.00 MYR

[Read Only | [ Print Preview |

[check | [ Technical RFx Response | [ Save | [ Questions and Answers (0) |
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20.

Click Tracking tab control |

Tracking

Create RFx Response - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Create RFx Response
¥

History, Back Forward [=]

Detail || Compare
E: Version
[] The Table doesnot contain any data

Document/Version Type

Created On

Read Only || Print Preview

21,

Technical RFx Response Questions and Answers (0 )

Changed On

Create RFx Response Help
RFx Response Number 3000000391 RFx Number 6200000064 Status In Process Submission Deadline 28.10.2011 15:30:00 UTC+8 RFx Owner RFX_CREATEM Total Value 250.00 MYR
RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number 1
Read Only | | Print Preview Technical RFx Response Questions and Answers (0 )
RFxInformation | Hems | Notes and Attachments =~  Summary Tracking 1
29 Rfae RFx Versions
¥ Version Overview ]

Document Name

Click RFx Versions tab control = RF*Versiens  t4 view details of the response version.

Rev. Date: 28/10/2011
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Create RFx Response - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Create RFx Response | History, Back Forward E
¥
Create RFx Response Help
RFx Response Number 000000391 RFx Number E200000064 Status In Process Submission Deadline 28.10.2011 15:30:00 UTC+2 RFx Owner RFX_CREATE11 Total Value 250.00 MYR
RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number 1
22 it f w || Pri | { Technical RFx ] [Save | [ Questions and Answers (0) ]
Technical RFx Response
RFx Information [ f#ems -  Notes and Attachments ©  Summary racking
RFx Response Versions RFx Versions |
W Version Overview E
E. Version Document/Version Type Created On Changed On Document Name External Version Number
2 Active Document 28.10.2011 15:04:10 28102011 15:15:05 RFX_CREATE1128.10.2011 15:04._ 1
[Read Only | [ Print Preview |

[Check | [ Technical RFx Response | [ Save | [ Questions and Answers (0 |

22. To download any attachment for the bidder such as tender document, open the RFQ document

and click Technical RFx Response button [Technical RFx Response |

Tech. Responses - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Tech. Responses

¥

w mySAP PLM

cFolders
Home
=la|
Folder EXTERNAL AREA

#iTachnical Datails
<0

B TECHHICAL BID
23 -F———3For Bidder

Current Path: Collaboration > ... > EXTERNAL AREA
Folder

=) EXTERNAL AREA To save any changes made, click Save.
Name EXTERNAL AREA
Subscribe r
Authorization Read

Not\ﬁcations”Addmonal Functions “|Cance\|

Folder Contents
Namea
Empty

Current Version Read

Choose an object to display the folder objects. To copy objects, select the required objects and then choose Copy.

Status

| History, Back Forward E

Collaboration on the Web
Refresh Search Favorites Settings Help Logout

Help

Copy as Bookmark

Changed by Changed on

Rev. Date: 28/10/2011
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23. Click For Bidder label For Bidder,

Tech. Responses - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Tech. Responses

¥
w mySAP PLM
cFolders

B
GliTechnical Details
= MNavigation:  Folder Overview
DD TECHMICAL BID Current Path: Collaboration > ... > For Bidder > Tender Document

= For Bidder
Ul EXTERNAL AREA

| History, Back Forward [=)

Collaboration on the Web

Refresh Favorites Settings Help Logout

Document Tender Document

Document

Choose Save to save changes made to the name or description (or alias if available).

Name Tender Document
Subscribe

Write Lock

Authorization | Read

(]

Discussions 0

‘Not\ﬁcatinnﬁ”Addmonal Functions ‘HCance\l

Versions

Name |File | |File SizelDe.r.criplion ‘Redlining Layers Changed by Changed on
24 ersion—t{Tender Document docx | | 13.959|Tender Document | - VSOFFIAN |06.09.2011 15:18:16

24. Click Tender Document.docx label Tender Document docx

File Download
File Download [ [ S|

Do you want to open or save this file?

@_, Mame: Tender Document.docx

= Type: Microsoft Word Document

From: wcenhcmwml0.petronas.com.my

Cpen ] [ Save ]—[—Euncd—]—— 25

harm your computer. f you do not trust the source, do not open or

l@ While files from the Intemet can be useful, some files can potentialhy
save this file. What 's the rigk?

25. Click Save button _

Rev. Date: 28/10/2011 (For Internal Use Only) Prepared By: PQL
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Save As
Save As ﬁ
P — - - - 1
£ » Libraries » Documents » - Search Document
S @ EIT D t | 42 | D i
Organize « Mew folder == - u@u
It Favorites — Documents library Arrange by: _Folder =
Bl Desktop Includes: 2 locations
:h_"- Recent Places | Mame * -
4. Downloads b |8
| users 4 My Documents (56)
C:h\Users\rosfazlina.afathi
- Libraries i . BlackBerry
&| Documents . Bluetooth Exchange Folder
| J‘-‘ Music . eFiling
b=| Pictures . Fax
- Fromn | an "
B videos ~ I F -
File name: -
Save as type: [Microsuft Word Document v]
. 5 | . 26
«  Hide Folders ave I =armeet T

Click Save button .

File Download

HeBownload E=EE X

o

Tenderfe20Document.do ok from veenhomyvml0, petronas. com.my

Estimated time left:
Download to: CUsers'rosfaz.. \Tender Document . docc

Transfer rate:
97 —+—{| Close this dialog box when download completes
|

Cpen OInern
L L ) L L

27. Click Close this dialog box when download completes check box
[ Close this dizlog box when download completes
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The next steps show how to upload Technical Response RFx documents to Purchaser via
Z portal.

Rev. Date: 28/10/2011 (For Internal Use Only) Prepared By: PQL



WORK INSTRUCTION Page: 18 of 26

PETRONAS

SUPPLIER RELATIONSHIP MANAGEMENT (SRM) Revision: Approved

BE Manage eRFx (for Bidder - 2 Tier Evaluation)v2

Tech. Responses - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Document Tender Document Help.

#iTechnical Dtails
Mavigation:  Folder Overview

m TECHHICAL BID Current Path:  Collaboration > ___ > For Bidder > Tender Document
QO For Bidder Document
U EXTERNAL AREA
Choose Save to save changes made to the name or description (or alias if available).
Name [ Tender Document |
Subscribe
Write Lock
Authorization | Read =
Discussions 0
Nohﬁcatmns”Addmonal Functions AHCancell
Versions
Name |Fi|e | |File Size‘Deﬁcriplion ‘Redlining Layers ‘Changed by|Changed on
Version 1|Tender Document.docx | | 13.959 Tender Document | - \VSOFFIAN |06.09.2011 15:18:16

28. Click TECHNICAL BID label TECHNICAL BID

Tech. Responses - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Tech. Responses | History, Back Forward

B S

Home Refresh Search Favorites gs Help Logout

Collaboration on the Web

=)
- Folder SRM_TANJUNG Helo
@lTechnical Details
<0 Current Path: Collaboration = .. > ... > SRM_TANJUNG
<0.. Folder

29 rSRM_TANJUNG

T COLLABORATION To save any changes made, click Save.

T EXTERNAL AREA
Name | SRM_TANJUNG ]
Subscribe
Authorization | Read ]

Noti‘ﬁcations||Additmna\ Functions AHCanceH

Choose an object to display the folder objects. To copy objects, select the required objects and then choose Copy.

Folder Contents Copy as Bookmark
|Namef_\. |Current Version ‘Read |Slatu5 |Changed by Changed on
O[COtech Bid | \ | |cFx Senice 28.10.2011 15:18:29

29. Click SRM_TANJUNG label SRM_TANJUNG
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PETRONAS

Tech. Responses - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Tech. Responses | History, Back Forward E
L]

mySAP PLM

cFolders Collaboration on the Web

Home
=

Refresh Search Favorites  Settings Help  Logout

Folder SRM_TANJUNG Helo.
WiTechnical Details
<0 Current Path: Collaboration = ___ > __ = SRM_TANJUNG
<0 .. Folder
D@M To save any changes made, click Save
[ COLLABORATION v ehang : i
) EXTERNAL AREA
Name | SRM_TANJUNG ]
Subscribe
Autharization | Read ]
|Noti‘ﬁcations||Mditmna\ Functions AHCance\l
Choose an object to display the folder objects. To copy objects, select the required objects and then choose Copy.
Folder Contents Copy as Bookmark
|Namea |Current Version ‘Read Status |Changed by Changed on
30 ShETech Bd | \ | |CFX Senice 26.10.2011 15:18:29

30. Click Tech_Bid label I2ch_Bid,

Tech. Responses - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Tech. Responses | History, Back Forward E
L]

mySAP PLM

cFolders

Collaboration on the Web

Home Refresh  Search Faw
L) i
E Folder Tech_Bid Helo
BiTechnical Details . .
<0 Curmrent Path: Collaboration = . > > SEM TAMJUNG > Tech_Bid
<0.. Folder
B To save any changes made, click Save
& Tech_Bid v chang ' -
. COLLABORATION . N
T EXTERNAL AREA Name | Tech_Bid |
Subscribe
Authorization [ Write ]

| Notifications ||Additmn al Functions AH Cancel |

To create folder objects, select Create. To copy or delste objects, select the required objects and then choose Copy or

Delete.

Folder Contents Upload PDX Package ooy as Bookma 31
Namex Current Version ‘Read Status ‘Changed by |Changed on

Empty

31. Click Create label Create,
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Tech. Responses - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Tech. Responses
L]

mySAP PLM

cFolders | N Collaboration on the Web
Home Favorites  Settings Help Logout
2|al

#iTachnical Datails

Create Object Hele

MNavigatipn:  Folder Overview

vﬂ TECHHICAL BID Current [Path: Collaboration > ... > TECHNICAL BID > SRM_ELMO = Tech_Bid > Create Object
<0 5RM_ELMO
@M What dp you want to create?
& For Bidder CFolddr A folder is used to structure the collaboration and is also a container for storing objects.

C EXTERNAL AREA

A bill of material structures materials and represents a directory of all parts (items) that belong to a
material.

WlDatalSheet A data shest structures specification and classification information.

ShBill of Material

’@Dc»cument A document can contain any file in different versions.

Y
laterial A material is an item (product, goods and so on) that is created, used in production, traded, or consumed.
Enote A note is for adding a short descriptive text and can have versions.

32. Click Document label Document,

Tech. Responses - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Tech. Responses
]

mySAP PLM

cFolders

Collaboration on the Web
Setting

Home Favorites Help Logout

®la
Il Create Document Hele.
fiTechnical Details - X
- Navigation:  Folder Ovenview
vlj TECHNICAL BID Current Path: Collaboration > > TECHMICAL BID > SRM_ELMO > Tech_Bid > Create D\
ﬂ% Create Document
ech_Bi
] For Bidder Enter the name and a description. Decide whether or not you want to upload a local file now or later. Then choose Next.
D) EXTERNAL AREA
Hams I
Description -
Subscribe -
PGP Documents E You are only allowed to use PGP files in this document.

@ Upload Local File
() Create File Later

33. Enter Document Name

Rev. Date: 28/10/2011 (For Internal Use Only)
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34. As required, complete/review the following fields:

Field R/O/C Description
Name R

Name that identifies an entity.

Example:
Tender Response

Description R Text to identify and characterize an object or activity.

Example:
Tender Document Response from ELMO

Tech. Responses - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Tech. Responses

¥
w mySAP PLM
cFolders

tory—Boek—Formari—{=1- 35

Collaboration on the Web

Home Favorites  Settings Help Logout
=
Create Document Hele
WiTechnical Details
-0 Mavigation:  Folder Qverview
VD TECHMICAL BID Current Path: Collaboration > ... > TECHNICAL BID > SRM_ELMO > Tech_Bid > Create Document
VDM Create Document
S Tech_Bid
) For Bidder Enter the name and a description. Dicide whether or not you want to upload a local file now or later. Then choose Next.
) EXTERNAL AREA
Name ender Response *
Description ender Document Response fram ELMO
Subscribe I
PGP Documents M| You are only allowed to use PGP files in this document.
@ Upload Local File
") Create File Later
36

35. Click radio button @ Upload Local file or you may click on button Create File Later if the
Technical Response document still not ready yet .

36. Click Continue labe! EEREMNE.
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Tech. Responses - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Tech. Responses I History, Bask_Farward EI-_‘ 37

¥
o
E cFolders e - Collaboration on the Web

Home Favorites  Settings Help Logout
2lal
#iTachnical Datails

Create Version

Mavigation:  Version Overiew

vﬂ TECHHICAL BID Current Path: Collaboration > ___ > TECHNICAL BID > SRM_ELMO > Tech_Bid > Tender R > Create Version
VQW To select the required file, choose Browse pnd then Save.
O For Bid:frh—BId
C EXTERMAL AREA [ || Browse |

37. Click Browse... button to locate your document.
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Choose File to Upload

€& Choose File to Upload 2
Cle Bl Desktop »
@ ‘a-—{f-—l— —— 2 * | -—
Organize = Mew folder
u . = vl survey latest
0 Favorites |£| == | Microsoft Excel Worksheet
Ml Desktop Ul | 106 KB
| Recent Places @ 3 T&C for RFQ
4 Downloads |_i Microsoft Word Document
| USErs —1 136 KB
5 il Tender Document - Response from
38 —— W5 Eimo
e L1Dranes — | Microsoft Word Document
E] Documents =
. wal ender Document
J’ Music |£i 4 Microsoft Word Document
|| Pictures =1 136 KB
B videos . TM-5RM Supplier Reporting - |E|
Supplier Guide B
m Computer aobe Adobe Acrobat Decument
E_?‘ Local Disk (C:) = - TM-5RM5US Credit Memo -
File name: = | AllFiles () -
’ Open ] ’ Cancel ]
. ender Document - Response from
38 Tender D Response f

Double-click ltems to upload

W

| Elmo
= | Microsoft Word Document
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Tech. Responses - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Tech. Responses

mySAP PLM

cFolders | N Collaboration on the Web
Home Favorites  Settings Help Logout

2lal
#iTachnical Datails

Create Version

MNapvigation:  Version Overiew

vﬂ TECHHICAL BID Current Path:  Collaboration > ___ > TECHNICAL BID > SRM_ELMO > Tech_Bid > Tender R > Create Version
ﬂw To pelect the required file, choose Browse and then Save.
T Tech_Bid
0 For Bidder
) EXTERNAL AREA | clusersirosfazlina afathiDesktop\Te|| Browse . |

R [cancel

39. Click Save label EEIE.

Tech. Responses - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Tech. Responses
]

mySAP PLM

cFolders

on the Web

Home

| History, Back Forward [=]

Gl

Folder Tech_Bid Help.
@iTechnical Details .
- Current Path: Collaboration > ... > TECHMICAL BID > SRM_ELMO > Tech_Bid
<) TECHNICAL BID Eoidar
=] SRM_ELMO
= Tech Bid To save any changes made, click Save.
O For Bidder -
) EXTERMAL AREA Name [ Tech_Bid ]
Subscribe
Authorization [ Write |
Notrﬁcatinns”Add\t\onal Functions ‘HCancell
To create folder objects, select Creafe. To copy or delete objects, select the required objects and then choose Copy or
Delete.
Folder Contents Upload PDX Package Co& Copy as Bookmark|
‘Namen Current Version Read  Status Changed by (Changed on
71 BiTender R Tender Document - Response from Elmo.docx Elmo 06.09.2011
e — )] Sesame 16:12:69

40. Click Logout label RN

40
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Create RFx Response - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Create RFx Response
¥

History—Bask—Forward{=1 41

Changed On
28.10.2011 15:15:05

B Version DocumentiVersion Type Created On
2 Active Document 28.10.2011 15:04:10
[Read Only | [ Print Preview | | [Check ] [ Technical RFx Response | [ Save | [ Questions and Answers (0]

41. Click Check button

Create RFx Response - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Create RFx Response ok,
RFx Response NHumber 000000391 RFx Number| 8200000064 Status In Process Submission Deadline 28.10.2011 15:30:00 UTC+8 RFx Owner RFX_CREATE11 Total Value 250.00 MYR
RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number 1
Read Only | [ Print Preview [Technical Rrx Response Questions and Answers (0)
RFx Information ;[ H#ems -  Notes and Attachments /'  Summary Tracking
RFx Response Versions RFx Versions

Document Name External Version Number

RFX_CREATE11 28102011 15:04 . 1

Create RFx-R¢

¥

EL Version DocumentVersion Type Created On Changed On
2 Active Document 28.10.2011 15:04:10 28102011 15:15:05
[Read Only | [ Print Preview | [Technical RFx Response | [ Save | [ Questions and Answers (0) |

42. Click Submit button [Submit ]

Create RFx Response Help
RFx|Response Number 000000381 RFx Number 8200000064 Status In Process Submission Deadline 28102011 15:30:00 UTC+8 RFx Owner RFX_CREATE11 Total Value 250.00 MYR
RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Humber 1
i} RAx response is complete and contains no errors
Submit ['Read Only | [ Print Preview | [Technical RFx Response | [ Save | [ Questions and Answers (0) |
RFx Information ;[ H#ems -  Notes and Attachments /'  Summary Tracking
RFx Response Versions RFx Versions

Document Name External Version Number

RFX_CREATE11 28102011 15:04 . 1
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@ The system displays message, " RFx response is complete and contains no errors”.

Create RFx Response - SAP NetWeaver Portal

Create RFx Response
¥

History, Back Forward E

43. Click Close button [Clese]

Display RFx Response 9000000225 e
RFx Response Number 9000000225 RFx Number E200000058 Status Submitted Submission Deadline 12.08.2011 10:00:00 UTC+2 Opening Date 12.08.2011 10:00:00 UTC+3
Remaining Time 0 Days 17:55:17 RFx Owner VSOFFIAN Total Value 10,00 MYR RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number 1
RFx response 9000000225 submitted
43 - Print Preview Refresh Technical RFx Response || Withdraw | | Questions and Answers (0 ) || System Information | | Create Memory Snapshot
Close Application
RFxInformation | Hems | Notes and Attachments =~  Summary Tracking |
RFx Response Versions RFx Versions
¥ Version Overview ]
E. Version DocumentVersion Type Created On Changed On Document Name
2 Active Document 17.08.2011 15:59:29 17.08.2011 15:5929
[ Print Preview | | [Refresh| | [Technical RFx Response | [ Withdraw | [ Questions and Answers (0 ) | [ System Information | [ Create Memory Snapshot |

The system displays message, "RFx response 9000000225 submitted”. The system status

3 changed to "Submitted".
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